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Sturt Noble
A s s o c i a t e s

Podium courtyard

Ginkgo biloba

Red glaze

Anson Property Group engaged Sturt Noble Associates to 
prepare a Master Plan for the Development Application of 
Burwood Square Commercial/ Residential Development 
and public realm works.

The Public domain design is laid in a striking set out to 
generate interest and assist wayfinding. Off form concrete 
planters with coloured glazed brick inlay are designed to 
provide multiple seating opportunities to plaza and future 
development and mounded to accommodate larger 
shade trees. 

All private domain works are located on a basement 
podium requiring careful consideration of soil depths and 
level changes. A communal BBQ area is located at the 
northern end of communal including sustainably sourced 
timber shelter structure, picnic tables and timber topped 
platform seating.

Larger feature trees chosen for their seasonal show, canopy 
shelter and amenity are located in minimum 900mm depth 
of soil incorporated into 1: 20 accessible slope. In select 
locations lawn areas roll up to deeper soil for planting 
negating the need for additional concrete walls in all areas.  

Multiple small group and individual opportunity spaces 
are located across the sites and timber topped off form 
concrete benches form larger group social areas. Areas 
to immediate north of the Temple are open to the general 
public and a potential café space is located here. 
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